W € g u@e—(T)04/0007/2003—10 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—10

The Gazette of Fudia

- EXTRAORDINARY
T I—a¥avs 1

"PART II — Section 1
wfeerR ¥ yifeE

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T 7] ¢ feeelt, dreEn, A 23, 2010 / ¥R 2, 1932
Noa. 7] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MARCH 23,2010 / CHAITRA 2, 1932

T o 7 i T W @ ot ¥ Rred B 9 orem Wae @ w0 @ W

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation,

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 23rd March, 2010/Chaitra2, 1932 (Saka)

THE DAMAN AND DIU CIVIL COURTS (AMENDMENT)
REGULATION, 2010

No. 1 or 2010
Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of India.
A Regulation further to amend the Goa, Daman and Diu Civil Courts Act, 1965 as in

force in the Union territory of Daman and Diu.

Tn exercise of the powers conferred by article 240 of the Constitution, the President is
pleased to promulgate the following Regulation made by her:—

_ 1. (1) This Regulation may be called the Daman and Diu Civil Courts (Amendment) Short title and
Regulation, 2010, _ _ ' » ) commencement,

(7) It shall come into force at once.

16 0f 1965, 2.1 the Goa, Daman and Diu C1v11 Courts Act, 1965, as-in force in the Umontemtory -Amendment of
of Daman and Div, (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 2, after clause (o), ~section 2.
the following proviso shail be inserted, namely:— L

‘Prov ded that, on and from the cammencement of the Damar and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of clauses (a), (c) and (d), in
retation to Daman and Diu, shail have effect as if for the words “Goa, Daman and Div”,
the words “Daman and Diu” had been substituted.’.




Amendment
of section 4.

Amendment’
of section 7.

- Insertion of
new section
14A.

Sections 10,
i1, 12, 13 and
14 not to
apply to
Daman and
Diu.

Amendment
of section 20.

Amendment
of section 21.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[PARTII—

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this section shall have effect
in relation to Daman and Diu as if for the word “Panjim”, the words “Daman and Diu”
had been substituted.’.

4. In section 7 of the principal Act, in sub-sectlon (1), the following proviso shall be

mserted namely:— .

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section, in relation
to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words, “The District Judge shall have
general control”, the words “Subject to the control of the High Court, the District
Judge shall have general control” had been substituted.’.

5. After section 14 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“14A. Nothing contained in sections 10, 11, 12, 13 and 14 shall, on and from the
commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010,
apply to Daman and Diu.”

6. In section 20 of the principal Act,—
(i) in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,
in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil
Judges and Junior Civil Judges”, the words and brackets “Civil Judges (Senior
Division) and Civil Judges (Juhior Division)” had been substituted.”;

(#) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

ik

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu

Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,

in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil

" Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division)” had been
substituted.’;

(ifi) in sub-section (3), after the prov1so the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-section (3), on and from
the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation,
2010, shall apply to Daman and Diu.”; :

(iv) after sub-s_ection (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely.—

“(4) On and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil Courts
(Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the _;arlsdlctlon of a Civil Judge (Junicr Division),
- inrelation to Daman and Diu, extends to all original suits and proceedings of a

civil nature wherem the subject matter does not exceed in amount or value one
lakh rupees.”.

7. In section 21 of the princi pal Act,—

- (iyin sub-section (/ ), the foll owing proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that, on nd from’ the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Cou'ts (Amendmenl Regulation, 2010 the prowsxom of this sub-sectlon,



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 3

in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior or
Junior”, the words “Senior Division or Junior Division” had been substituted.’;

(ii) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from'the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,
in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if—

(a) for the words “Senior Civil Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil
Judge (Senior Division)” had been substituted;

(b) for the words “Junior Civil Judge”, occurring at both the places,
. the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Junior Division)” had been
substituted.’.

8. In section 22 of the principal Act, the followmg proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this section, in relation to
Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “twenty-five thousand rupees”
the words “one lakh rupees” had been substituted.’.

9. In section 23 of the principal Act,—
() in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,
in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Seniot Civil
Judge” and “Junior Civil Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior
Division)” and “Civil Judge (Junior Division)” had respectively been
substituted.’;

(i) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

~ ‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,
in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil
Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division)” had been
substituted.’;

-(#ii) in sub-section (3), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu

Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section, -

in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil
Judge”, at both the places where they occur, the words and brackets “Civil
Judge (Senior Division)” had been substituted.’. -

- 10. Insection 24 of the principal Act, — .
A (1) in sub-section (7), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely —

“Provided that, on and from the commencenent of the Daman and Diu

- Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,
in relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil
Judge one thousand and five hundred rupees and in the case of Junior Civil
Judge five hundred rupees”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division)
three thousand rupees and in the case of Civil Judge ( Junior D1v1s1on) one

Amendment

-of section 22,

Amendment

- of section 23.

Amendment .

“of section 24.

thousand- five hundred rupees” had been substituted.’;

'




Amendment

of section 25.

Amendment

of section 26.

Amendment

of section 27.

Amendment

of section 28.

Amendment

of section 29.

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [P ARt TI—

(7i) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section,
in refation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil
Judge” and “Junior Civil Judge”, occurring at both the places, the words and
brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division)” and “Civil Judge (Junior Division)” had
respectively been substituted.”.

11. Insection 25 of the brincipa{l Act, after sub-section (2), the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely:f—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section, in relation
to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “ten thousand rlipees”, the
words “one lakh rupees” had been substituted.’. '

12. Insection 26 of the principal Act, after the proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

‘Provided further that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu

Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the-provisions of this sub-section, in

. relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil Judge”,
the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division)” had been substituted.’.

13. Insection 27 of the principal Act, after sub-section (2) ‘the followmg provnso shall
be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section, in relation
to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “District Judge and Assistant
Judge”, the words “District Judge” had been substituted.’.

14. Insection 28 ofthe principal Act, in sub-section (1 ), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Reguiation, 2010, the provisions of this sub-section, in relatlon
to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if—

(a) for the words “the Senior-most Assistant Judge if any or the
Senior-most Civil Judge”, the words “Senior-most Civil Judge” had been
substituted;

(b) for the words “Assistant Judge or Civil Judge”, the words “Civil Judge”
had been substituted.’.

15. Section 29. of the principal Act, the followmg proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the prov151ons ofthis section, in relation to the
Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if—

(@) for the words “the’Assistant Judge, or in the absence of an Assistant
Judge to a Civil Judge”, the words “toa Ciyil Judge” had been substituted;

(&) for the words “ASSIStant or Civil Judge”, the words “Civil Judge” had
been substituted.’.




SEC. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDJA EXTRAORDINARY 5

16. In section 33 of the principal Act, the following proviso shall be inserted, Amendment
namely:— ' of section 33.

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this section, in relation to
Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words, figures and brackets “notified by
the High Court under section 21 of the Goa, Daman and Diu (Judicial Commissioner’s

Reg. 10 of Court) Regulation, 1963”, the words “notiﬁed by the High Court” had been substituted.”.

1963. .
17. In section 34 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),— Amendment
. of section 34.
‘(9 in clause (b), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this clause, in
relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil
Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division)” had been
substituted;’;

(i7) in clause (c), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the.commencement of the Daman and Diu
Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this clause, in
relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Junior Civil
Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Junior Division)” had been
substituted;’; ’

(iii) in clause (d), ;he following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu

Civil Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this clause, in

relation to Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil

Judge or Junior Civil Judge”, the words “Civil Judge (Senior Division) or Civil
-Judge (Junior Division)” had been substituted.’.

18. In section 35 of the prinéipal Act, the following proviso shall be inserted, Amendment -
. namely:— ) - : of section 35. -

‘Provided that, on and from the commencement of the Daman and Diu Civil
Courts (Amendment) Regulation, 2010, the provisions of this section, in relation to
Daman and Diu, shall have effect as if for the words “Senior Civil Judge and the court
of Junior Civil Judge”, the words and brackets “Civil Judge (Senior Division) and the
court of Civil Judge (Junior Division)” had been substituted.’.

PRATIBHA DEVISINGH PATIL,
President.

V. K. BHASIN,
Secy. to the Govt. of India.

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVT. OF [ND_iA PRESS, MINTO RGAD, NEW DELHI AND
PUBLISHED. BY. THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS DELHI-2010.

GMGIPMRND-~1347GH($5)—26+03-2010.







